

ASPPP LOTS (1-91)				WINNING
SOUVENIR PAGES				BIDS
LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
1	88-48	\$8.75 EXPRESS SINGLE PAGE \$8.75	\$35.00	no bid
2	03-18	.37 PURPLE HEART DUAL FDC OF BOTH STAMPS 5-30-03 AND 8-1-03	\$7.00	\$2.00
3	02-01	.34 WINTER SPORTS	\$2.50	no bid
4	03-35	.37 FLAG	\$2.50	no bid
5	02-02	MENTORING A CHILD	\$5.00	no bid
STAMP POSTER WITH FIRST DAY CANCEL				
LOT	USPS #	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
6	1321	.05 CHRISTMAS FDC 11-10-1966 FLAT H/C	\$15.00	no bid
7	1322	.05 MARY CASSATT FDC 11-17-1966 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	\$6.00
8	1323	.05 NATIONAL GRANGE FDC04-17-1967 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	no bid
9	1329	.05 VOICE OF AMERICA FDC 08-01-1967 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	no bid
10	1333	.05 URBAN PLANNING FDC 10-02-1967 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	no bid
11	1305	.06 ROOSEVELT HORIZONTAL COIL FDC 02-28-1968 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	\$3.00
12	1338	.06 FLAG FDC 02-24-1968 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	no bid
13	1288	.15 HOLMES FDC 03-09-1968 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	no bid
14	1364	.06 AMERICAN INDIAN FDC 11-04-1968 FLAT H/C	\$10.00	\$3.00
15	1370	.06 GRANDMA MOSES FDC 05-01-1969 FLAT H/C	\$15.00	\$7.00
16	1424	.06 GENERAL MACARTHUR FDC 01-26-1971 FLAT H/C	\$20.00	\$6.00
U.S.P.S. YEAR SETS				
LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
17	77-1/21	1977 YEAR SET - 21 PAGES	\$60.00	no bid
18	80-1/25	1980 YEAR SET - 25 PAGES	\$67.50	no bid
REGIONAL COMMEMORATIVE PANELS				
LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
19	1999	CACHET COMMEMORATIVE YEAR OF THE RABBIT SILK CACHET COMMEMORATIVE PANEL WIT	\$7.00	no bid
PORTER PHILATELIC PAGES				
LOT	PPP#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
20	3	TRADITIONAL CHRISTMAS	\$5.00	no bid
21	4	JEROME KERN	\$5.00	no bid
22	5	ABRAHAM BALDWIN	\$5.00	no bid
23	7A	AMERIPEX '86 PPP WITH ADDED SHOW CANCEL	\$5.00	no bid
24	8A	FREDERIC BARTHOLDI PPP WITH LIBERTY CENT.	\$5.00	no bid
25	13	PAN AM GAMES	\$5.00	\$2.00
26	52	WILLIAM T. PIPER	\$5.00	no bid
27	75	BENJAMIN FRANKLIN (50C)	\$5.00	\$2.00
ASPPP OWNED COMMEMORATIVE PANELS				
(SHRINK WRAP IS OPENED UNLESS INDICATED "SEALED")				
LOT	YEAR	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
28	1972	#2 MAIL ORDER SEALED	\$9.00	no bid
29	1972	#4 TOM SAWYER SEALED	\$17.50	no bid
30	1972	#6 CHRISTMAS #7208 SEALED	\$12.50	\$3.00
31	1972	#7 CHRISTMAS SEALED	\$12.50	\$3.00
32	1972	#8 STAMP COLLECTING	\$10.00	\$7.00
33	1975	#44,#46,#56,#57, AND #58 - 5 SEALED PANELS	\$66.00	no bid
34	1976	#60,#61,#66,#67,#70, AND #72 - 6 SEALED PANELS	\$91.00	\$15.00
35	1979	#112,113, AND #116 - 3 SEALED PANELS	\$42.00	\$3.00
36	1980	#137 SEALED	\$15.00	\$2.00
37	1981	#147, 149, AND #151 - 3 SEALED PANELS	\$75.00	\$3.00
38	1982	157,161,162,163,164,165,166,168,169,171 - 10 SEALED PANELS	\$176.00	no bid
39	1987	#274-298 1987 COMPLETE YEAR SET 25 PANELS SEALED	\$190.00	no bid
40	1989	#321-342 1989 COMPLETE YEAR SET 22 PANELS SEALED	\$180.00	no bid
41	1999	#574 XTREME SPORTS	\$15.00	no bid
42	2002	#645-676 COMPLETE YEAR SET 32 PANELS		\$121.00
43	2003	#677-698 COMPLETE YEAR SET 22 PANELS		\$137.00
44	2003	#681 OHIO STATEHOOD	\$15.00	no bid
45	2003	#696 STOP FAMILY VIOLENCE	\$15.00	no bid
46	2004	#702 PAUL ROBESON	\$6.00	\$6.00
47	2005	#728 LUNAR NEW YEAR	\$14.95	no bid
48	2005	#729 MARIAN ANDERSON	\$6.00	\$6.00

49	2005	##730 RONALD REAGAN	\$6.00	no bid
50	2005	#731 LOVE: BOUQUET	\$6.00	no bid
51	2005	#732 NORTHWEST DECIDUOUS FOREST	\$14.95	no bid
52	2005	#733 SPRING FLOWERS	\$6.00	no bid
53	2005	\$734 ROBERT PENN WARREN	\$6.00	no bid
54	2005	#735 YIP HARBURG	\$6.00	no bid
55	2005	#736 AMERICAN SCIENTISTS	\$6.00	no bid
56	2005	#737 MASTERWORKS OF MODERN AMERICAN ARCHITECTURE	\$14.95	no bid
57	2005	#738 HENRY FONDA	\$6.00	no bid
58	2005	#740 AMERICAN ADVANCES IN AVIATION	\$14.95	no bid
59	2005	#741 NEW MEXICO RIO GRANDE BLANKETS	\$6.00	no bid
60	2005	#744 ARTHUR ASHE	\$6.00	\$6.00
61	2005	#745 TO FORM A MORE PERFECT UNION	\$14.95	no bid
62	2006	#753 TRUE BLUE	\$15.00	\$6.00
63	2006	#754 FAVORITE CHILDREN'S BOOK ANIMAL	\$32.50	\$14.95
64	2006	#758 OUR WEDDING .39	\$15.00	\$6.00
65	2006	#759 OUR WEDDING .63	\$15.00	\$6.00
66	2006	#771 HAPPY BIRTHDAY	\$15.00	\$6.00
67	2006	#780 KWANZAA	\$15.00	\$6.00
68	2007	#786 HENRY WADSWORTH LONGFELLOW	\$15.00	\$6.00
69	2007	#790 HEARTS (\$0.41)	\$15.00	\$6.00
70	2007	#791 HEARTS (\$0.91)	\$15.00	\$6.00
71	2007	#799 JURY DUTY	\$15.00	\$6.00
72	2007	#801 EID	\$15.00	\$6.00
73	2007	#807 KWANZAA	\$15.00	\$6.00
74	2007	#810 MARJORIE KINNAN RAWLINGS	\$6.00	\$6.00
75	2010	#845 CELEBRATING LUNAR NEW YEAR	\$15.00	no bid
76	2010	#846 VANCOUVER 2010	\$15.00	no bid
77	2010	#848 ABSTRACT EXPRESSIONISTS	\$15.00	no bid
78	2010	#851 ANIMAL RESCUE	\$6.00	no bid
79	2011	#862 CELEBRATING LUNAR NEW TEAR	\$6.00	no bid
80	2011	#863 KANSAS STATEHOOD	\$6.00	no bid
81	2011	#864 RONALD REAGAN	\$6.00	no bid
82	2001	#865 LATIN MUSIC LEGENDS	\$6.00	\$6.00
83	2011	#866 JAZZ	\$6.00	\$6.00
84	2011	#868 GO GREEN	\$14.95	\$14.95
85	2011	#869 HELEN HAYES	\$6.00	\$6.00
86	2011	#872 INDIANAPOLIS	\$6.00	\$6.00
87	2011	#873 AMERICAN SCIENTISTS	\$6.00	no bid
88	2011	#874 MARK TWAIN	\$6.00	no bid
89	2011	#876 OWNEY THE POSTAL DOG	\$6.00	no bid
90	2011	#877 U.S. MERCHANT MARINE	\$6.00	no bid

ASPPP BINDERS

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
91	BINDERS	TWO USPS BINDERS EXCELLENT CONDITION	\$30.00	\$4.00
92		(LOT REMOVED)		

END OF ASPPP LOTS

U.S. COMMEMORATIVE PANELS

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
93	1977	#76 SOLO LINDBERG - MINOR TONING	\$100.00	\$5.00
94	1979	#120 VIETNAM VETERANS - SEALED	\$10.00	\$3.00
95	1982	#160 BIRDS & FLOWERS - OHIO - VIRGINIA - SEALED	\$30.00	no bid
96	1982	#160 BIRDS & FLOWERS - HAWAII - MICHIGAN - SEALED	\$30.00	no bid
97	1983	#190 MEDAL OF HONOR SEALED	\$30.00	\$2.00
98	1984	#236 VIETNAM VETERANS SEALED	\$20.00	\$2.00
99	1986	#263-266 PRESIDENT OF THE UNITED STATES - 4 PANELS SEALED FACE \$7.84	\$50.00	\$8.00
100	1987	#282-286 NORTH AMERICAN WILDLIFE 5 PANELS SEALED FACE \$11.00	\$60.00	no bid
101	1988	#300 CONNECTICUT SEALED	\$5.00	no bid
102	1988	#306 MARYLAND SEALED	\$5.00	no bid
103	1989	#332 LOU GEHRIG SEALED	\$50.00	\$4.00
104	1989	#336 LETTER CARRIERS SEALED	\$10.00	no bid
105	1990	#352 THE OLYMPIANS SEALED	\$20.00	\$2.00
106	1991	#374 JAN MATZELIGER SEALED	\$15.00	no bid
107	1991	#359-377 COMPLETE YEAR SET SEALED - 19 PANELS	\$150.00	no bid
108	1992	#378 TO 405 YEAR SET - 23 PANELS SEALED - MISSING 397-404	\$275.00	no bid
109	1992	#378-405 YEAR SET - 28 PANELS SEALED - INCLUDES COLUMBIANS AND WILDFLOWERS	\$675.00	no bid

110	1992	#397 - 399 COLUMBIANS SET SEALED	\$275.00	\$44.00
111	1992	#378 WINTER OLYMPICS SEALED	\$10.00	\$2.00
112	1992	#379 WORLD COLUMBIAN EXPO SEALED	\$10.00	no bid
113	1992	#380 W.E.B. DUBOIS SEALED	\$10.00	no bid
114	1992	FIFTEEN SEALED PANELS RANGE FROM #281 TO396	\$150.00	no bid
115	1992	FIFTEEN SEALED PANELS RANGE FROM #281 TO396 & 405	\$150.00	no bid
116	1993	#406-430 YEAR SET 25 PANELS SEALED	\$325.00	no bid
117	1994	#433 DR. ALLISON DAVIS SEALED	\$20.00	no bid
118	1994	#434 HAPPY NEW YEAR OF THE DOG SEALED	\$22.50	no bid
119	1994	#435 LOVE SEALED FACE - \$2.90	\$17.50	no bid
120	1994	#445 POPULAR SINGERS SEALED	\$20.00	no bid
121	1994	#447 JAZZ SINGERS SEALED - FACE - \$2.90	\$25.00	no bid
122	1995	#467 LOUIS ARMSTRONG SEALED	\$25.00	no bid
123	1996	#479 ERNEST J. JUST SEALED	\$20.00	\$3.00
124	1997	#513 BENJAMIN FRANKLIN SEALED	\$20.00	\$25.00
125	1997	#524 AIR FORCE SEALED	\$20.00	\$8.00
126	1997	#514 GEORGE WASHINGTON SEALED	\$20.00	\$10.00
127	1997	#529 MADONNA FACE - \$6.40	\$25.00	\$6.00
128	1998	#533 MADAM C.J. WALKER SEALED	\$20.00	no bid
129	1998	#536 ALEXANDER CALDER SEALED	\$17.50	no bid
130	1998	#540 - TRANS-MISSISSIPPI SEALED	\$30.00	no bid
131	1998	#544 GOSPEL SINGERS SEALED	\$17.50	no bid
132	1998	#549 BRIGHT EYES SEALED	\$17.50	\$3.00
133	1998	#551 AMERICAN ART SEALED	\$30.00	no bid
134	2003	#680 FILM MAKING SEALED	\$15.00	no bid

SOUVENIR PAGES MISSING FIRST DAY CANCEL OR STAMP WITH FDC

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
135	74-1A	.26 MOUNT RUSHMORE E73 WATERMARK MISSING FDC	\$40.00	\$4.00
136	74-3A	.18 STATUE OF LIBERTY E73 - MISSING FIRST DAY CANCEL	\$40.00	\$5.00
137	80-7	.15 FRANCES PERKINS - MISSING FDC	\$6.00	\$3.00
138	82-23	.20 MARY WALKER - MISSING FDC	\$6.00	\$3.00
139	87-3	.22 PAN AMERICAN GAMES - HAS FDC BUT NO STAMP	\$6.00	\$21.00

USPS MINT STAMP POSTERS

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
140	MSP 210	.05 TWIN SPACE - FLAT - 1967 OF - 270-629	\$10.00	\$3.50
141	MSP 260	.06 APOLLO 8 - FLAT - 1969 OF - 334-552	\$10.00	\$3.50
142	MSP 268	.10 MOON LANDING FLAT - 1969 OF -360-995	\$10.00	\$3.50
143	MSP 270	.06 BASEBALL - FLAT - 1969 OF-361-518	\$20.00	no bid
144	MSP 270	.06 BASEBALL FOLDED - 1969 OF-361-518	\$5.00	\$3.00
145	MSP 271	.06 FOOTBALL FLAT - 1969 OF-361-925	\$10.00	no bid
146	MSP 371	.08 LYNDON B. JOHNSON - FLAT	\$2.00	\$4.00
147	MSP 384	.26 MOUNT RUSHMORE E73 WATERMARK- FLAT	\$40.00	\$5.00
148	MSP 388	.18 STATUE OF LIBERTY E73 WATERMARK - FLAT	\$10.00	\$2.00
149	MSP 396	.10 100TH ANNIVERSARY UNIVERSAL POSTAL UNION - FLAT	\$2.00	no bid
150	MSP 399	.10 CONTINENTAL CONGRESS - FLAT	\$2.00	\$1.00
151	MSP 418	.10 MARINER - FLAT	\$2.00	no bid
152	MSP 419	.10 LEXINGTON AND CONCORD - FLAT	\$2.00	no bid
152	1965-1980	198 DIFFERENT MINT STAMP POSTERS FOLDED	\$100.00	no bid
154	1966-1980	122 MINT STAMP POSTERS FLAT	\$122.00	no bid
155	1969-1977	33 ALL DIFFERENT STAMP POSTERS - 11 FLAT - 22 FOLDED	\$16.00	\$2.00
156	1972	23 ALL DIFFERENT STAMP POSTERS - 6 FLAT - 17 FOLDED	\$23.00	no bid

USPS STAMP POSTERS WITH FIRST DAY CANCEL

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
157	1338A	.06 AMERICAN FLAG FDC H/C FLAT	\$10.00	\$6.00
158	1343	.06 LAW AND ORDER H/C FLAT	\$20.00	no bid
159	1364	.06 AMERICAN INDIAN FDC H/C FLAT	\$12.50	\$7.00
160	1369	.06 AMERICAN LEGION FDC FLAT H/C	\$12.50	no bid
161	1382	.06 FOOTBALL FDC FLAT H/C	\$25.00	no bid
162	1383	.06 DWIGHT EISENHOWER FDC FLAT H/C	\$12.50	\$3.00
163	1384	.06 CHRISTMAS FDC FLAT H/C	\$12.50	no bid
164	1385	.06 CRIPPLED CHILDREN AND ADULTS FDC FLAT H/C	\$12.50	\$3.00
165	1386	.06 HARNETT AMERICAN PAINTING FDC FLAT H/C	\$12.50	no bid
166	1971-1980	14 DIFFERENT STATIONARY, POST CARDS WITH FDC ON STAMP POSTERS, 13 FLAT, 1 FOLDED	\$70.00	\$36.00

BOOKLET VARIETIES				
LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
167	78-19	.15 ROSE BOOKLET - LEFT BOTTOM STAMP	\$5.00	no bid
168	78-19	.15 ROSE BOOKLET - LEFT CENTER STAMP	\$5.00	no bid
169	78-19	.15 ROSE BOOKLET - RIGHT CENTER STAMP	\$5.00	no bid
170	78-19	.15 ROSE BOOKLET - RIGHT BOTTOM STAMP	\$5.00	no bid
171	80-3	.18 WINDMILLS BOOKLET – LINE VISIBLE BOTTOM \$1.50 FACE	\$20.00	\$6.00
172	81-4	.18 "B" BOOKLET - LINE VISIBLE TOP \$1.80 FACE	\$20.00	no bid
173	81-4	.18 "B" BOOKLET – LINE VISIBLE BOTTOM \$1.80 FACE	\$20.00	no bid
174	81-12	.18 WILDLIFE BOOKLET LINE AT TOP FACE \$1.80	\$20.00	no bid
175	81-58	.20 FLAG BOOKLET "RED ROOF" OVER SUPREME COURT FACE \$1.20	\$15.00	\$3.50
176	82-1	.20 BIGHORNED SHEEP - LINE VISIBLE LEFT \$2.00 FACE	\$20.00	\$7.00
177	82-1	.20 BIGHORNED SHEEP LINE VISIBLE RIGHT \$2.00 FACE	\$20.00	\$7.00
178	85-4A	.22 "D" BOOKLET SMALL 1984 WATERMARK \$2.20 FACE	\$12.50	\$3.00
179	85-18	.22 FLAG BOOKLET - RED FLAG POLE \$1.10 FACE	\$6.00	no bid
180	88-52/53	.25 SPECIAL OCCASIONS BOOKLET NO GUIDE LINES \$3.00 FACE	\$30.00	no bid
181	88-52	.25 SPECIAL OCCASIONS BOOKLET GUIDE LINE TOP \$1.50	\$20.00	no bid
182	88-52	.25 SPECIAL OCCASIONS BOOKLET GUIDE LINE BOTTOM \$1.50 FACE	\$20.00	no bid
183	88-53	.25 SPECIAL OCCASIONS BOOKLET GUIDE LINE TOP \$1.50 FACE	\$20.00	no bid
184	88-53	.25 SPECIAL OCCASIONS BOOKLET GUIDE LINE BOTTOM \$1.50 FACE	\$20.00	no bid
185	88-52/53	.25 SPECIAL OCCASIONS BOOKLET COMPLETE SET - 4 PAGES \$6.00 FACE	\$50.00	\$5.00
186	89-26	.25 CHRISTMAS PLATE #1	\$10.00	no bid
187	89-26	.25 CHRISTMAS BKLT-RED SQUARE - RED ANGLE IN TAB FACE \$2.75	\$20.00	\$7.00 Tie
188	89-27	.25 CHRISTMAS PLATE # 11111	\$10.00	no bid
189	89-27	.25 CHRISTMAS - BLACK SQUARE IN TAB \$2.75 FACE	\$20.00	\$6.00
190	90-2	.25 LOVE BOOKLET - RED SQUARE IN TAB \$2.75 FACE	\$20.00	\$4.00
191	90-2	.25 LOVE BOOKLET BLACK ANGLE IN TAB \$2.75 FACE	\$20.00	\$4.00
192	90-11	.25 LIGHTHOUSE - PLATE #1	\$10.00	no bid
193	90-23	.25 CHRISTMAS PLATE 1 \$2.75 FACE	\$10.00	no bid
194	90-23	.25 CHRISTMAS – RED/BLACK SQUARE IN TAB \$2.75 FACE	\$25.00	\$4.00
195	90-24	.25 CHRISTMAS RED SQUARE IN TOP OF TAB \$2.75 FACE	\$20.00	\$6.00
196	91-12	.29 FLOWERS RED GUIDE MARK RIGHT	\$30.00	no bid
197	91-14	.29 DUCKS BOOKLETS NO HOLE IN TOP BOOKLET \$5.80 FACE	\$15.00	no bid
198	91-14	.29 DUCKS BOOKLET HOLE IN TOP TAB OF BOOKLET \$5.80 FACE	\$15.00	no bid
199	91-19	.29 LOVE BOOKLET - PLATE # 1111 FACE \$3.71	\$15.00	no bid
200	91-19	.29 LOVE - BLUE SQUARE IN TAB PLATE 1111 FACE \$3.71	\$20.00	\$4.00
201	91-26	.29 FISHING FLIES PLATE # 23133 FACE \$1.45	\$25.00	\$1.75
202	91-26	.29 FISHING FLIES PLATE # 23213 FACE \$1.45	\$25.00	no bid
203	91-26	.29 FISHING FLIES PLATE # 23133 - HAS PURPLE & ORANGE LINE IN TAB	\$35.00	\$20.00
204	91-26	.29 FISHING FLIES PLATE # 32225 FACE \$1.45	\$20.00	no bid
205	91-56	.29 CHRISTMAS PLATE #1	\$10.00	no bid
206	91-56	.29 CHRISTMAS - RED SQUARE - RED ANGLE IN TAB FACE \$3.19	\$20.00	\$6.00
207	91-57	.29 CHRISTMAS - TWO PAGES - VARIOUS BOOKLET SINGLE	\$25.00	\$7.50
208	92-22	.29 HUMMINGBIRDS PLATE A212122 "O" WATERMARK FACE \$1.45	\$25.00	no bid
209	92-36	.29 WILD ANIMALS RED GUIDE LINE ON LEFT CENTER	\$25.00	no bid
210	92-39	.29 CHRISTMAS - RED - YELLOW - ORANGE ANGLE IN TAB FACE \$3.19	\$25.00	\$7.00
211	93-02	.29 SPACE FANTASY PLATE# 2222	\$15.00	no bid
212	93-14	.29 GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE# 1 BLACK ANGLE IN TAB	\$20.00	\$2.00
213	93-14	.29 GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE #1 FACE \$1.45	\$20.00	no bid
214	93-22	BROADWAY MUSICALS FACE \$1.16	\$5.00	no bid
215	93-26	.29 COUNTRY & WESTERN CARTER FAMILY SINGLE STAMP AT BOTTOM	\$20.00	no bid
216	93-27	.29 AFRICAN VIOLET - NO HOLE IN TAB FACE \$2.90	\$20.00	no bid
217	93-27	.29 AFRICAN VIOLET - HOLE IN TAB FACE \$2.90	\$20.00	no bid
218	93-29	.29 CHRISTMAS SNOWMAN & BULGAR AT BOTTON - ORANGE AND GREEN IN TAB	\$25.00	\$10.00
219	93-30	.29 CHRISTMAS PLATE K11111 NO HOLES IN TAB FACE \$1.45	\$20.00	no bid
220	93-30	.29 CHRISTMAS PLATE K11111 TWO HOLES IN TAB FACE \$1.45	\$20.00	no bid
221	94-11	.29 GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE 2 FACE \$1.45	\$20.00	no bid
222	94-11	.29 GARDEN FLOWER PLATE 2 - SMALL BLACK LINE IN TAB FACE \$1.45	\$20.00	no bid
223	94-11	.29 GARDEN FLOWER PLATE 2 - LARGE BLACK LINE IN TAB FACE \$1.45	\$20.00	no bid
224	94-30	.29 MADONNA & CHILD PLATE 2 NO HOLE IN TAB FACE \$3.19	\$20.00	\$3.00
225	94-30	.29 MADONNA & CHILD PLATE 1 SMALL BLUE LINE NO HOLE IN TAB FACE \$3.19	\$20.00	\$3.00
226	94-30	.29 MADONNA & CHILD PLATE #1 SMALL BLUE LINE WITH HOLE IN TAB	\$20.00	no bid
227	94-31	.20 HOLIDAY '94 STOCKING - END OF BOOKLET FACE \$1.45 FACE	\$15.00	\$5.00
228	RC94G3	THREE DIFFERENT BOOKLET POSITIONS ON PAGE	\$15.00	\$5.00
229	94G1,G2,G3	SIX DIFFERENT BOOKLET SINGLE POSITIONS	\$30.00	\$10.00
230	95-14	.32 LOVE SECOND STAMP TOP CENTER BOOKLET FACE \$1.74	\$10.00	no bid
231	95-14	.32 LOVE SECOND STAMP TOP RIGHT BOOKLET FACE \$1.74	\$10.00	no bid
232	95-14	.32 LOVE SECOND STAMP BOTTOM RIGHT BOOKLET FACE \$1.74	\$10.00	no bid

233	95-15	.32 FLAG OVER PORCH - TWO DIFFERENT BOOKLET SINGLES	\$10.00	\$2.00
234	95-19	.32 PINK ROSE - LEFT CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	\$1.50
235	95-19	.32 PINK ROSE - CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	\$1.50
236	95-19	.32 PINK ROSE - TOP RIGHT BOOKLET	\$10.00	\$3.00
237	95-28	.32 PEACHES AND PEARS - TWO DIFFERENT BOOKLET SINGLES	\$10.00	\$3.00
238	95-38	.32 GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE 1 FACE \$1.60	\$20.00	\$3.25
239	95-38	.32 GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE 2 RED ANGLE IN TAB \$FACE \$1.60	\$20.00	no bid
240	95-38	.32 GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE 2 SMALL BAR IN TAB	\$20.00	no bid
241	95-41	.32 CHILDREN AND SANTA - TWO DIFFERENT BOOKLET POSITION	\$15.00	\$3.00
242	95-46	.32 GIOTTO'S MADONNA PLATE 1 WITH HOLE IN TAB	\$25.00	no bid
243	95-46	.32 GIOTTO'S MADONNA PLATE 1 WITH BLACK ANGLE WITH HOLE IN TAB	\$25.00	no bid
244	95-46	.32 GIOTTO'S MADONNA PLATE 1 WITH BIG BLACK LINE NO HOLE IN TAB	\$25.00	no bid
245	95-46	.32 GIOTTO'S MADONNA PLATE 1 WITH BLACK AND BLUE ANGLE WITH HOLE IN TAB	\$25.00	\$2.50
246	95-46	.32 GIOTTO'S MADONNA PLATE #1 WITH SMALL BLACK LINE IN TAB	\$25.00	no bid
247	95-47	.32 MIDNIGHT ANGEL LEFT CENTER BOOKLET SINGLE	\$10.00	no bid
248	95-47	.32 MIDNIGHT ANGEL RIGHT CENTER BOOKLET SINGLE	\$10.00	no bid
249	96-02	.32 WINTER GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE #1 LARGE BLACK LINE IN TAB FACE \$1.60	\$20.00	no bid
250	96-02	.32 WINTER GARDEN FLOWERS PLATE #1 SMALL BLACK LINE IN TAB FACE \$1.60	\$20.00	no bid
251	96-03	.32 LOVE TOP RIGHT BOOKLET SINGLE	\$15.00	\$1.00
252	96-27	.32 IOWA STATEHOOD BOTH CENTER BOOKLET SINGLES	\$15.00	no bid
253	96-28	.20 BLUE JAY - LEFT STAMP RIGHT CENTER BOOKLET STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
254	96-28	.20 BLUE JAY - LEFT STAMP LEFT CENTER BOOKLET STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
255	96-39	MADONNA & CHILD RIGHT STAMPS BOTTOM CENTER POSITION	\$10.00	no bid
256	96-39	MADONNA & CHILD RIGHT STAMP BOTTOM LEFT POSITION	\$10.00	\$3.00
257	96-40	.32 YELLOW ROSE RIGHT CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	no bid
258	97-02	.32 FLAG - LEFT CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	no bid
259	97-31	.32 MADONNA TOP CENTER BOOKLET	\$12.50	no bid
260	97-31	.32 MADONNA CENTER BOOKLET	\$12.50	\$3.00
261	97-32	.32 AMERICAN HOLLY RIGHT CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	\$3.00
262	98-13	.32 FOLK MUSICIANS LEADBELLY TOP LEFT STAMP	\$15.00	\$3.50
263	98-13	.32 FOLK MUSICIANS JOSH WHITE TOP LEFT STAMP	\$15.00	no bid
264	98-17	.32 GOSPEL SINGERS - SISTER ROSETTA TOP LEFT STAMP	\$15.00	no bid
265	98-17	.32 GOSPEL SINGERS - ROBERTA MARTIN TOP LEFT STAMP	\$15.00	\$3.50
266	98-31	.32 MADONNA CENTER BOTTOM BOOKLET STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
267	98-31	.32 MADONNA TOP CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	\$3.00
268	98-36	"H" UNCLE SAM ALL THREE ARE RIGHT CENTER BOOKLET SINGLES	\$10.00	\$7.00
269	99-07	.33 CITY FLAGS RIGHT STAMP IS LEFT CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	no bid
270	99-15	.33 TOPICAL FLOWERS BOTH TOP STAMP ARE LEFT AND RIGHT CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	no bid
271	99-40	.33 MADONNA AND CHILD TOP CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	no bid
272	00-05	.33 FRUIT BERRIES - TOP STAMPS LEFT AND RIGHT TOP BOOKLETS	\$10.00	no bid
273	00-09	.33 CORAL PINK ROSE - CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	no bid
274	01-03	.34 FLOWERS VARIOUS BOOKLET POSITIONS	\$10.00	no bid
275	01-14	.34 LOVE STAMP LEFT STAMP IS TOP RIGHT BOOKLET SINGLE	\$10.00	\$3.00
276	01-45	.34 CHRISTMAS - CENTER BOOKLET SINGLE	\$10.00	\$3.00
277	02-11	.37 ANTIQUE TOYS VARIOUS BOOKLET POSITIONS	\$10.00	no bid
278	03-33	.37 CHRISTMAS BOTTOM CENTER BOOKLET	\$10.00	\$3.00
279	`04-03	.37 CANDY HEARTS - RIGHT OTOM BOOKLET SINGLE	\$10.00	\$3.00
280	`04-27	.37 MARTIN JOHNSON HEADE - LEFT CENTER POSITION	\$10.00	\$3.00
281	04-33	.37 CHRISTMAS TOP CENTER BOOKLET SINGLE	\$10.00	no bid
282	04-33	.37 CHRISTMAS BOTTOM CENTER BOOKLET SINGLE	\$10.00	\$3.00
283	04-37	.37 CHRISTMAS STAMPS - TWO PAGES- NUMBERS DIFFERENT BOOKLET SINGLES BOTH SIDE	\$10.00	no bid

LINES ON ONE SIDE OF STAMP

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
284	73-21	.10 CROSSED FLAGS - BLUE LINE ON RIGHT OF STAMP	\$10.00	\$6.00
285	73-21	.10 CROSSED FLAGS - RED LINE ON RIGHT OF STAMP	\$10.00	\$6.00
286	73-23	.13 AIR MAIL COIL LINE VISIBLE RIGHT	\$40.00	\$6.00
287	75-20	.03 PARKMAN COIL LINE VISIBLE TOP LEFT	\$20.00	no bid
288	75-20	.03 PARKMAN COIL LINE VISIBLE TOP RIGHT	\$20.00	\$6.00
289	75-20	.03 PARKMAN COIL LINE VISIBLE ON TOP OF BOTH STAMPS	\$30.00	\$11.00
290	77-19	.10 FREEDOM TO PETITION LINE LEFT - RIGHT STAMP	\$20.00	no bid
291	77-19	.10 FREEDOM TO PETITION LINE RIGHT - RIGHT STAMP	\$20.00	\$3.00
292	77-20	.03 FRANCIS PARKMAN LINE VISIBLE TOP	\$20.00	\$3.00
293	78-7	.16 STATUE OF LIBERTY LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	\$3.00
294	78-15	.15 HOLMES - LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$25.00	\$3.00
295	78-20	7.7 SAXHORNS LINE VISIBLE RIGHT	\$25.00	\$3.00
296	78-20	7.7 SAXHORNS LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$25.00	\$3.00
297	80-10	3.5 VIOLINS LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$25.00	no bid

298	80-10	3.5 VIOLINS LINE VISIBLE RIGHT	\$25.00	\$3.00
299	81-3	.18 "B" LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	\$3.00
300	81-5	.12 FLAME LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	no bid
301	81-15	.01 QUILL AND PEN LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	\$3.00
302	81-18	.17 ELECTRIC AUTO LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	no bid
303	81-27	.20 "C" LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	\$3.00
304	82-7A	5.9 BICYCLE 1981 WATERMARK LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	\$3.00
305	82-20	.02 LOCOMOTIVE COIL LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	no bid
306	83-36	.18 SURREY COIL LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	no bid
307	83-38	.05 MOTORCYCLE LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$30.00	no bid
308	85-32	3.4 SCHOOL BUS COIL LINE VISIBLE LEFT-TOP	\$20.00	\$3.00
309	85-33	.11 STUTZ BEARCAT COIL LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	\$3.00
310	86-18	.20 FIRE PUMPER LINE VISIBLE LEFT	\$20.00	\$3.00

BIRDS AND FLOWERS PAGES

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
311	82-10	.20 BIRDS & FLOWERS 11 X 10 1/2 W80 WATERMARK BLUE PAGE	\$25.00	\$5.00
312	82-10/14	.20 BIRDS & FLOWERS 11X11 TOP & BOTTOM - RARE TO FIND A COMPLETE SET	\$150.00	no bid
313	82-10/14	.20 BIRDS & FLOWERS 10.5 X 11 TOP & BOTTOM - 5 PAGES	\$100.00	no bid
314	87-17/21	.22 WILDLIFE 5 PAGES - FACE \$11.00	\$20.00	\$4.50
315	92-12/17	COLUMBUS SOUVENIR SHEETS 6 PAGES	\$50.00	\$21.00
316	92-23/27	.29 WILDFLOWERS 5 PAGES - FACE \$14.50	\$30.00	no bid

EXPRESS PAGES - HI-VALUE PAGES

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
317	83-29	\$9.35 EXPRESS MAIL SINGLE	\$100.00	no bid
318	83-29A	\$9.35 EXPRESS MAIL END SINGLE	\$100.00	no bid
319	83-30	\$9.35 EXPRESS MAIL BOOKLET OF THREE	\$200.00	no bid
320	85-25	\$10.75 EXPRESS SINGLE	\$40.00	\$21.00
321	85-26	\$10.75 EXPRESS MAIL BOOKLET OF THREE	\$110.00	no bid
322	88-48	\$8.75 EXPRESS SINGLE	\$25.00	no bid
323	89-19	\$2.40 PRIORITY MAIL	\$17.50	no bid
324	91-61/63	\$9.95, \$2.90 & \$14.00 EXPRESS PAGES	\$125.00	no bid
325	93-17	\$2.90 PRIORITY MAIL STAMP	\$10.00	\$1.75
326	94-21	\$9.95 MOON LANDING	\$35.00	\$10.25
327	94-24	\$5.00 WASHINGTON/JACKSON	\$17.50	\$2.00
328	95-25	\$3.00 CHALLENGER SPACE SHUTTLE	\$20.00	\$6.00
329	95-31	\$10.75 SPACE SHUTTLE ENDEAVOR	\$37.50	\$10.50
330	97-33	\$3.00 MARS PATHFINDER	\$20.00	\$6.00
331	0109	\$3.50 U.S. CAPITOL	\$17.50	\$5.00

**LINE PAIRS
DESCRIPTION**

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
332	76-9	.09 FREEDOM TO ASSEMBLE	\$40.00	\$2.00
333	81-3	.18 "B" LINE PAIR	\$40.00	no bid
334	81-5	.12 FLAME LINE PAIR	\$30.00	\$11.00
335	81-27	.20 "C" LINE PAIR	\$30.00	no bid

RARE SOUVENIR PAGES AND RARE STAMP POSTERS

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
336	72-11	.08 MAIL ORDER "DOUBLE TAILED CAT"	\$75.00	\$25.00*
337	72-13	.08 TOM SAWYER - RED INK SHIFT IN FENCE TO RIGHT	\$25.00	no bid
338	72-13	.08 TOM SAWYER - RED INK SHIFT IN FENCE TO LEFT	\$25.00	\$3.00
339	73-23	.13 A/M PART OF SECOND STAMP ON COIL FDC	\$10.00	\$5.00
340	74-2E	.10 ZIP CODE ERROR APRIL 4, 1974 CANCEL	\$600.00	\$55.00*
341	74-17	6.3 COIL LINE PAIR - ONLY THREE COPIES KNOWN	\$600.00	\$55.00
342	75-1	.10 BENJAMIN WEST FDC WITH PLATE SINGLE #35393	\$30.00	\$3.00
343	75-12	BATTLE OF BUNKER HILL - SCOTT# 1564 PLATE #, SCOTT # 1034 W/FDC E4 WATERMARK	\$75.00	\$10.00
344	76-1	.13 SPIRIT OF 76 87TH TOURNAMENT OF ROSES SPECIAL CANCEL 1-1-1976 IN RED INK	\$750.00	no bid
345	78-12	"A" STAMPS PLACED WRONG ON PAGE	\$10.00	\$25.00
346	79-14	.30 COUNTY SCHOOLHOUSE FDC WITH PLATE SINGLE	\$50.00	\$15.00
347	79-16	.50 AMERICAN SERIES - STAMP POSTER PRINTING VISIBLE AT BOTTOM	\$7.50	no bid
348	79-23	.15 WILL ROGERS - NO TRACK MARKS	\$10.00	\$4.00
349	79-23A	.15 WILL ROGERS - ARROWS GOING LEFT	\$10.00	no bid
350	79-23B	.15 WILL ROGERS - ARROWS GOING RIGHT	\$10.00	no bid
351	81-20	.18 DISABLED PERSONS FDC TYPE 1	\$10.00	\$1.00
352	81-20	.18 DISABLED PERSONS FDC TYPE 11	\$10.00	\$1.00
353	81-21	.18 EDNA ST. VINCENT MILLAY - BROKEN "N" IN MILLAY	\$12.50	no bid

354	81-22A	.18 ALCOHOLISM TRACK MARKS GOING LEFT	\$10.00	\$2.00
355	81-22B	.18 ALCOHOLISM TRACK MARKS GOING RIGHT	\$10.00	\$2.00
356	81-22C	.18 ALCOHOLISM NO TRACKS	\$15.00	no bid
357	81-28	"C" BOOKLET - WHITED LINE ON RIGHT SIDE OF PAGES - MISCUT PAGE	\$15.00	\$5.00
358	82-09	10.9 HANSOM CAB - CANCEL AND STAMP SHIFTED TO THE RIGHT	\$10.00	\$2.50
359	82-22	.20 BARRYMORE FAMILY - INK SMEAR ON PICTURE ON BOTTOM FDC	\$25.00	\$4.00
360	83-34	.20 METROPOLITAN OPERA - TAGGING ON STAMP	\$10.00	\$3.00
361	83-34	.20 METROPOLITAN OPERA - NO TAGGING ON STAMP	\$10.00	\$3.00
362	87-33	17.5 RACING CAR - DOT IN RIGHT 7 OF COIL	\$10.00	\$3.00
363	87-33	17.5 RACING CAR - DOT IN BOTH OF "7"	\$25.00	\$3.00
364	88-15	.25 PHEASANT BOOKLET - MAJOR SHIFT RED IN SKY - VERY RARE ON PAGE	\$450.00	\$28.00
365	90-10	\$1.00 SEAPLANE - SMALL TAGGING 1ST STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
366	90-10	\$1.00 SEAPLANE - LARGE TAGGING 1ST STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
367	90-10	\$1.00 SEAPLANE - SMALL TAGGING 2ND STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
368	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING 1ST STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
369	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON -LAGES TAGGING 1ST STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
370	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - LARGE TAGGING 1ST STAMP - TOP AND RIGHT	\$20.00	\$10.00
371	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING LEFT- 2ND ST STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
372	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING RIGHT 2ND STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
373	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING LEFT 4TH STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
374	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING RIGHT 4TH STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
375	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING CENTER 4TH STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
376	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING RIGHT 5TH STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
377	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING TOP ACROSS AND ON 5TH STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
378	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - WIDE TAGGING 5TH STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM	\$20.00	\$10.00
379	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - SMALL TAGGING ACROSS BOTTOM OF ALL STAMPS	\$20.00	\$10.00
380	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - WIDE TAGGING ACROSS ALL BOTTOM STAMPS	\$20.00	\$10.00
381	90-17	.05 CIRCUS WAGON - WIDE TAGGING 5TH STAMP - TOP TO BOTTOM- STRIP IS UNSIDE DOWN	\$75.00	\$15.00
382	93-18	.29 HANK WILLIAMS 10X10 PERFORATIONS RARE	\$25.00	\$3.00
383	93-18	.29 HANK WILLIAMS 11X11 PERFORATIONS	\$10.00	\$5.00
384	94-34	\$2.00 JAMES MADISON - DOUBLE IMPRESSION ON BOTTOM OF 4TH STAMP	\$150.00	\$15.00

AUTOGRAPHED SOUVENIR PAGES, PANELS, AND SPECIAL CANCEL PAGES

LOT	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
386	72-8	OLYMPIC GAMES BOTH AUTOGRAPHED BY DESIGNER LYNN WYMAN PLUS 8X10 COLOR PICTI	\$25.00 no bid
387	86-7	REPUBLIC OF TEXAS - AUTOGRAPHED BY PRESIDENT GEORGE BUSH SON	\$500.00 no bid
388	86-7	REPUBLIC OF TEXAS - AUTOGRAPHED BY GOVERNOR RICK PERRY	\$100.00 no bid
389	88-5	.22 JAMES JOHNSON FDC AND SECOND DAY CANCEL	\$10.00 no bid
390	1989	#3432 COMMEMORATIVE PANEL AUTOGRAPHED BY ASTRONAUT RICHARD SHEAFF	\$25.00 no bid
391	89-11	EXECUTIVE BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY VICE-PRESIDENT WALTER MONDALE	\$100.00 no bid
392	89-11	EXECUTIVE BRANCH - AUTOGRAOHEH BY JOAN MONDALE - WIFE OF V.P. WALTER MONDALE	\$75.00 no bid
393	89-11	EXECUTIVE BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY VICE-PRESIDENT DAN QUAYLE	\$100.00 no bid
394	89-11	EXECUTIVE BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY MARLYN QUAYLE - WIFE OF V.P. DAN QUAYLE	\$75.00 no bid
395	89-11	EXECUTIVE BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY PRESIDENT GEORGE BUSH (41)	\$500.00 no bid
396	89-11	EXECUTIVE BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY PRESIDENT GERALD FORD	\$500.00 no bid
397	90-4	THE JUDICIAL BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY SUPREME COURT JUSTICE - JOHN STEVENS	\$100.00 no bid
398	90-4	THE JUDICIAL BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY SUPREME COURT JUSTICE - SANDRA O'CONNER	\$100.00 no bid
399	90-4	THE JUDICIAL BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY SUPREME COURT JUSTICE -RUTH BADER GINSBI	\$100.00 no bid
400	90-4	THE JUDICIAL BRANCH - AUTOGRAPHED BY SUPREME COURT JUSTICE - CLARENCE THOMAS	\$100.00 no bid
401	91-32	DESERT STORM - AUCTOGRAPHED NY GENERAL COLIN POWELL	\$200.00 \$25.00
402	91-32	DESERT STORM - AUCTOGRAPHED NY GENERAL NORMAN SCHWARZKOFF	\$200.00 \$20.00
403	91-37	BASKET BALL STAMP - AUTOGRAPHED BY ELVIN HAYES	\$75.00 no bid
404	94-16	WW.II ROAD TO VICTORY - AUTOGRAPHED BY COMMANDER LLOYD BUCHER - USS PUEBLO A	\$200.00 \$20.00
405	95-17	POW & MIA - AUTOGRAPHED BY SENATOR JOHN MCCAIN - POW IN HANOI HILTON	\$150.00 \$20.00
406	97-28	SUPERSONIC FLIGHT - AUTOGRAPHED BY CHUCK YEAGER - BROKE SOUND BARRIER	\$400.00 \$51.00
407	02-01	.34 WINTER SPORTS FDC CANCEL ON 1ST, 2ND, 3RD AND 4TH STAMP SHOW CANCEL	\$10.00 \$4.00
408	02-01	.34 WINTER SPORTS FDC CANCEL ON 1ST & 4TH STAMP SHOW CANCEL	\$10.00 no bid
409	02-02	.34 MEMTORING A CHILD FDC	\$3.00 no bid
410	02-02	.34 MENTORING A CHILD - AFDCS SHOW CANCEL	\$12.50 no bid
411	02-02	.34 MENTORING A CHILD FDC PLUS JAMES AUDUBON STAMP	\$10.00 no bid
412	02-19	.60 CLOVERLEAF EAGLE FDC + 47TH AFDCS SHOW CANCEL	\$10.00 no bid
413	02-19	PURPLE HEART PLUS 47TH AFDCS SHOW CANCEL + FDC OF REISSUE PURPLE HEART STAMP	\$10.00 \$2.00
414	03-18	PURPLE HEART FDC PLUS + FDC OF REISSUE PURPLE HEART STAMP	\$10.00 \$2.00
415	03-18	PURPLE HEART FDC PLUS + 4TH AFDCS SHOW CANCEL BOTH DAYS OF SHOW	\$10.00 \$2.00

PLATE NUMBER PAGES

LOT	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
416	85-5	.22 "D" OFFICIAL PLATE 1 POSITION 1	\$75.00 \$7.00

417	85-27	.06 TRICYCLE PLATE 1 POSITION 4	\$50.00	\$7.00
418	85-48	22.1 LETTERS PLATE 111111 POSITION 2	\$50.00	no bid
419	86-30	5.5 STAR ROUTE TRUCK PLATE 1 POSITION 5	\$50.00	no bid
420	87-16	.22 FLAG STAMP PLATE # T1 POSITION 1	\$75.00	\$7.00
421	92-29	.29 VENDING MACHINE PLATE #1 POSITION 3	\$75.00	\$7.00
422	95-08	.05 CIRCUS WAGON PLATE#S1 POSITION 1 BOTTOM - BACK # ON POSITION 2 TOP	\$75.00	\$7.00
423	96-12	.05 MOUNTAIN PLATE #S111 POSITION 3 BOTTOM	\$60.00	\$7.00
424	96-12	.05 MOUNTAIN PLATE #S111 POSITION 3 BOTTOM - BACK # ON POSITION 4 BOTTOM	\$75.00	\$7.00

**YEAR SETS
DESCRIPTION**

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
425	72-1/17	1972 YEAR SET - 17 PAGES	\$350.00	no bid
426	72-5/17	1972 SHORT SET - 13 PAGES	\$100.00	no bid
427	82-1-36	1982 YEAR SET - 36 PAGES LESS BIRDS AND FLOWERS	\$70.00	no bid
428	82-1-36	1982 YEAR SET - 36 PAGES INCLUDES BIRDS AND FLOWERS	\$120.00	no bid
429	6/1/1943	2006 TEAR SET - 43 PAGES - MISSING PAGES 06-02 AND 06-38	\$350.00	no bid

**SOUVENIR PAGES
DESCRIPTION**

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
430	72-01	.08 YELLOWSTONE PARSONS WATERMARK	\$125.00	no bid
431	72-03	.14 LAGUARDIA EAGLE 1971 WATERMARK	\$110.00	no bid
432	72-04	.11 CITY OF REFUGE PARSONS WATERMARK\$	\$140.00	no bid
433	72-04	.11 CITY OF REFUGE PARSONS WATERMARK\$	\$140.00	no bid
434	72-5A	.06 WOLF TRAP - 1971 WATERMARK	\$50.00	\$7.00
435	72-5B	.06 WOLF TRAP - 1972 WATERMARK	\$40.00	no bid
436	72-5C	.06 WOLF TRAP - PARSONS WATERMARK	\$40.00	no bid
437	72-6	.08 COLONIAL CRAFTSMAN EAGLE '72 WATERMARK	\$20.00	no bid
438	72-7	.11 MOUNT MCKINLEY EAGLE '72 WATERMARK	\$12.50	\$2.00
439	72-8	OLYMPIC GAMES EAGLE '72 WATERMARK	\$12.50	\$4.00
440	76-4/8	.13 STATE FLAGS FIVE PAGES - FACE \$6.50	\$50.00	\$6.00
441	76-15/8	BICENTENNIAL SOUVENIR SHEETS - 4 PAGES	\$50.00	\$6.00
442	83-1/5	OFFICIAL SET 5 PAGES	\$30.00	no bid
443	85-41	.44 JUNIPERO SERRA - ONE DARK PAGE AND ONE LIGHT PAGE	\$10.00	no bid
444	86-12/15	.22 PRESIDENTIAL S/S 4 PAGES - FACE \$7.92	\$25.00	no bid
445	87-17/21	.22 NORTH AMERICAN WILDLIFE FACE \$11.00	\$40.00	no bid
446	88-10	.22 KNUTE ROCKNE	\$5.00	no bid
447	92-23/27	.29 WILDFLOWERS 5 PAGES - \$14.50 FACE	\$50.00	no bid
448	92-33	.29 MINERALS - AZURITE FIRST STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
449	92-33	.29 MINERALS - VARISCITE FIRST STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
450	93-01	.29 ELVIS PRESLEY	\$10.00	\$3.00
451	93-06	.29 GRACE KELLY	\$10.00	\$4.00
452	93-23	NATIONAL POSTAL MUSEUM - LINDBERG FIRST STAMP	\$10.00	\$2.00
453	93-23	NATIONAL POSTAL MUSEUM - BEN FRANKLIN FIRST STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
454	93-25	.29 DEAF COMMUNICATION - SIGN LANGUAGE FIRST STAMP	\$5.00	no bid
455	93-31	.29 YOUTH CLASSIC - HUCKLEBERRY FINN FIRST STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
456	93-31	.29 YOUTH CLASSIC - REBECCA FIRST STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
457	94-20	.50 NORMAN ROCKWELL S/S FDC	\$20.00	\$3.00
458	94-25	\$5.00 WASHINGTON/JACKSON	\$10.00	no bid
459	94-29	CRANES - WHOOPING CRANE 1ST STAMP	\$6.00	\$3.00
460	94-34	\$2.00 JAMES MADISON S/S - FACE - \$8.00	\$25.00	\$6.00
461	94-35	.20 LEGENDS OF THE WEST PLATE #S11111 POSITION 3 TOP	\$25.00	no bid
462	94-35	.29 LEGENDS OF THE WEST PLATE # S1111 POSITION 3 BOTTOM	\$25.00	no bid
463	1994-2004	92-42, 94-06, 94-35,00-01, 0106, 0205, 0302, 0402 - 8 CHINESE NEW YEAR FDC PAGES	\$50.00	no bid
464	RC94G1/G4	COMPLETE SET OF OLD GLORY "G" RATE CHANGE SERIES	\$20.00	no bid
465	95-16	.29 RECREATIONAL SPORTS	\$10.00	no bid
466	95-27	.32 CIVIL WAR - TOP LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
467	95-27	.32 CIVIL WAR - TOP CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
468	95-27	.32 CIVIL WAR - TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
469	95-27	.32 CIVIL WAR - BOTTOM LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
470	95-27	.32 CIVIL WAR - BOTTOM CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$3.00
471	95-27	.32 CIVIL WAR - BOTTOM RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
472	95-37	.32 JAZZ MUSICANS - COLEMAN HAWKINS 1ST STAMP	\$15.00	no bid
473	95-42	.32 COMIC STRIP CLASSICS TOP LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
474	95-42	.32 COMIC STRIP CLASSICS TOP CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	no bid
475	95-42	.32 COMIC STRIP CLASSICS TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
476	95-42	.32 COMIC STRIP CLASSICS BOTTOM RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
477	95-50	.32 ANTIQUE AUTOMOBILES -M DURYEA 1ST STAMP	\$10.00	\$2.00
478	96-17	.32 OLYMPIC GAMES - TOP LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	no bid

479	96-17	.32 OLYMPICS GAMES - TOP CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
480	96-17	.32 OLYMPICS GAMES - TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
481	96-17	.32 OLYMPIC GAMES - LOWER LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
482	96-17	.32 OLYMPICS GAMES - LOWER CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	no bid
483	96-17	.32 OLYMPICS GAMES - LOWER RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$3.00
484	96-31	.32 BIG BAND LEADERS - COUNT BASIE 1ST STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
485	96-34	ENDANGERED SPECIES PLATE# P2222 BOTTOM CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.00
486	96-34	ENDANGERED SPECIES PLATE# P2222 BOTTOM RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.00
487	96-34	ENDANGERED SPECIES PLATE# P4444 POSITION TOP LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.00
488	96-34	ENDANGERED SPECIES PLATE# P4444 POSITION BOTTOM LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.00
489	96-34	ENDANGERED SPECIES PLATE# P4444 POSITION BOTTOM CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.00
490	96-41	.50 CYCLING S/S	\$10.00	no bid
491	97-12	.32 DINOSAURS - FACE \$4.48	\$30.00	no bid
492	97-13	.50 PACIFIC '97 FRANKLIN S/S - FACE \$6.00	\$40.00	\$2.00
493	97-14	.60 PACIFIC '97 WASHINGTON S/S - FACE \$7.20	\$40.00	\$2.00
494	97-15	.32 BUGS BUNNY	\$10.00	no bid
495	97-18	.32 AMERICAN AIRCRAFT - TOP LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	no bid
496	97-18	.32 AMERICAN AIRCRAFT - TOP CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
497	97-18	.32 AMERICAN AIRCRAFT - TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
498	97-18	.32 AMERICAN AIRCRAFT - BOTTOM LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
499	97-18	.32 AMERICAN AIRCRAFT - BOTTOM CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$3.00
500	97-18	.32 AMERICAN AIRCRAFT - BOTTOM RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
501	97-19	AMERICAN DOLL PLATE 11111 TOP LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$3.00*
502	97-19	AMERICAN DOLL PLATE 11111 BOTTOM CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$3.00*
503	97-19	AMERICAN DOLL PLATE 11111 BOTTOM RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$3.00*
504	97-19	AMERICAN DOLL PLATE 33333 TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	no bid
505	98-09	SYLVESTER AND TWEETY	\$10.00	no bid
506	98-11	TRANS-MISSISSIPPI SHEET - FACE \$3.80	\$25.00	no bid
507	98-27	.32 AMERICAN ART PLATE S11111 TOP LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
508	98-27	.32 AMERICAN ART PLATE S11111 TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$3.00
509	98-27	.32 AMERICAN ART PLATE S11111 BOTTOM LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
510	99-11	.33 SONORAN DESERT	\$12.50	\$4.50
511	99-35	.33 INSECTS & SPIDERS PLATE # 2222 POSITION TOP LEFT	\$25.00	\$4.50
512	99-35	.32 INSECTS & SPIDERS PLATE # 2222 POSITION BOTTOM RIGHT	\$25.00	no bid
513	99-35	.32 INSECTS & SPIDERS PLATE #2222 POSITION BOTTOM LEFT	\$25.00	no bid
514	99-35	.32 INSECTS & SPIDERS PLATE #3333 POSITION BOTTOM LEFT	\$25.00	\$3.00
515	00-02	1980 CELEBRATE THE CENTURY - FACE \$4.95	\$25.00	no bid
516	00-07	.33 PACIFIC COAST RAINFOREST SHEET - FACE \$3.30	\$25.00	\$4.50
517	00-19	.33 THE STARS AND STRIPES POSITION TOP CENTER POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
518	00-19	.33 THE STARS AND STRIPES POSITION TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	\$4.50
519	00-19	.33 THE STARS AND STRIPES POSITION BOTTOM LEFT POSITION	\$25.00	no bid
520	00-19	.33 THE STARS AND STRIPES POSITION BOTTOM RIGHT POSITION	\$25.00	no bid
521	00-20	.33 LEGENDS OF BASEBALL PLATE 3333 TOP CENTER POSITION	\$30.00	\$7.50
522	00-20	.33 LEGENDS OF BASEBALL PLATE 3333 BOTTOM LEFT POSITION	\$30.00	\$7.50
523	00-20	.33 LEGENDS OF BASEBALL PLATE 4444 TOP CENTER POSITION	\$30.00	\$7.50
524	00-20	.33 LEGENDS OF BASEBALL PLATE 4444 TOP RIGHT POSITION	\$30.00	no bid
525	00-26	.33 DEEP SEA CREATURES FANFIN ANGELFISH FIRST STAMP	\$10.00	no bid
526	01-10	.34 AMERICAN ILLUSTRATORS PLATE 11111 POSITION TWO	\$25.00	\$4.50
527	01-32	.34 BASEBALL LEGENDARY PLAYING FIELDS PLATE# V1111 1ST POSITION TOP	\$30.00	\$7.50
528	01-32	.34 BASEBALL LEGENDARY PLAYING FIELDS PLATE# V1111 4RD POSITION TOP	\$30.00	\$7.50
529	1-Feb	.34 WINTER SPORTS CANCEL TYPE 1	\$10.00	\$3.00
530	02-05	.34 YEAR OF THE HORSE	\$10.00	no bid
531	02-07	.34 GREETINGS FROM AMERICA	\$25.00	no bid
532	03-01	.37 THURGOOD MARSHALL	\$15.00	no bid
533	03-14	.37 OLD GLORY FIVE STAMPS	\$10.00	no bid
534	03-18	.37 PURPLE HEART	\$10.00	\$1.00
535	03-24	.37 PURPLE HEART	\$10.00	no bid
536	00-03	.37 ZORA NEALE HURSTON	\$15.00	no bid
537	04-01	.37 PACIFIC CORAL REEF SHEET	\$20.00	\$4.50
538	04-04	.37 PAUL ROBERSON	\$15.00	no bid
539	04-13	.37 AMERICAN CHOREOGRAPHERS	\$10.00	no bid
540	04-15	.37 LEWIS & CLARK	\$20.00	\$4.00
541	04-16	.37 LEWIS & CLARK	\$15.00	\$2.00
542	04-18	.37 WW II MEMORIAL	\$10.00	\$2.00
543	04-21	.37 THE ART OF DISNEY	\$15.00	no bid
544	04-26	.37 JAMES BALDWIN	\$15.00	no bid
545	04-29	.37 ART OF THE AMERICAN INDIAN	\$25.00	no bid
546	04-30	.37 JOHN WAYNE	\$25.00	\$4.00

547	04-31	.37 SICKLE CELL DISEASE AWARENESS	\$15.00	no bid
548	04-32	.37 CLOUDSCAPES	\$25.00	no bid
549	04-34	HANUKKAH	\$10.00	\$8.00
550	04-35	.37 KWANZAA	\$15.00	no bid
551	04-37	.37 HOLIDAY ORNAMENTS - TWO 16 BOOKLET STAMP VARIOUS POSITION	\$45.00	\$5.00
552	05-01	.37 LUNAR NEW YEAR	\$20.00	no bid
553	05-02	.37 MARIAN ANDERSON	\$15.00	no bid
554	05-13	.37 AMERICAN ADVANCES IN AVIATION POSITION CENTER LEFT	\$25.00	\$4.80
555	05-18	.37 ARTHUR ASHE	\$15.00	no bid
556	05-24	.37 JIM HENSON	\$30.00	\$5.00
557	1998-2002	CELEBRATE THE CENTURY ALL 10 PAGES 1900 TO 1990	\$250.00	no bid
558	1998-2002	COMPLETE SET OF CELEBRATE THE CENTURY FDC USED SHEETS	\$100.00	no bid

**WATERMARK PAGES, VARIETY PAGES
DESCRIPTION**

LOT	USPS#	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
559	73-06	.08 COPERNICUS E73 WATERMARK	\$7.50	no bid
560	73-16A	.08 WILLA CATHER "THIN PAGE"	\$10.00	no bid
561	73-17	.08 COLONIAL DRUMMER "THICK PAPER"	\$20.00	no bid
562	74-1	.26 MOUNT RUSHMORE E73 WATERMARK	\$40.00	\$4.00
563	74-3A	.18 STATUE OF LIBERTY E73 WATERMARK	\$40.00	4.00*
564	74-13	.10 CONTINENTAL CONGRESS W74 WATERMARK	\$10.00	no bid
565	75-10A	.10 PAUL DUNBAR 1973 WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
566	75-10C	.10 PAUL DUNBAR 1974 WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
567	75-11C	.10 D.W. GRIFFITH "O" WATERMARK HARD TO FIND	\$30.00	\$3.00
568	75-26	.13 AMERICAN EAGLE PARSONS WATERMARK	\$20.00	\$3.00
569	76-1	.13 SPIRIT OF '76 PARSONS WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
570	76-10	.13 TELEPHONE BYRON WESTON 1974 WATERMARK VERY RARE	\$75.00	no bid
571	76-12	.13 CHEMISTRY BW1974	\$75.00	\$15.00
572	79-21D	3.1 GUITAR 1975 WATERMARK	\$25.00	\$3.00
573	80-16	.15 EDITH WHARTON PARSONS WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
574	80-17	.15 AMERICAN EDUCATION SCOTCH LINEN WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
575	81-35	.20 U.S. DESERT PLANTS BW81 WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
576	82-2	.20 RALPH BUNCHE BW1981 WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
577	82-8	.20 GEORGE WASHINGTON BW80 WATERMARK	\$20.00	\$3.00
578	82-8C	.20 GEORGE WASHINGTON BW82 WATERMARK	\$25.00	\$3.00
579	83-1A	.01 AND .13 OFFICIAL BW83 WATERMARK	\$15.00	\$3.00
580	83-4A	\$1.00 OFFICIAL BW83 WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$3.00
581	83-6B	.20 SCIENCE AND INDUSTRY BW83 WATERMARK	\$10.00	no bid
582	83-16A	.20 PHYSICAL FITNESS BW83	\$25.00	\$3.00
583	84-23	.20 DUCKS BW83 WATERMARK	\$7.00	\$3.00
584	84-23A	.20 DUCKS BW84 WATERMARK	\$7.00	no bid
585	84-27	.20 SMOKEY BEAR W83 WATERMARK	\$15.00	no bid
586	85-1A	.22 JEROME KERN SMALL BW84 WATERMARK	\$7.50	no bid
587	85-2A	.07 ABRAHAM BALDWIN SMALL 1984 WATERMARK	\$7.50	\$3.00
588	87-2	.22 MICHIGAN STATEHOOD BW1995 WATERMARK	\$6.00	no bid
589	87-3	.22 PAN AMERICAN GAMES BW1995 WATERMARK	\$6.00	\$3.00
590	87-4	.22 LOVE BW1985 WATERMARK	\$5.00	\$3.00
591	87-5	7.1 TRACTOR BW84 WATERMARK	\$15.00	\$3.00
592	87-7A	.22 JEAN BAPTISTE DUSABLE BW84 WATERMARK	\$25.00	\$3.00
593	88-5A	.22 JAMES WELDON JOHNSON BW87 WATERMARK	\$15.00	\$3.00
594	88-6A	.22 CATS BW87 WATERMARK	\$15.00	\$3.00
595	88-7A	.22 MASSACHUSETTS STATEHOOD BW87 WATERMARK	\$15.00	no bid
596	88-8A	.22 MARYLAND STATEHOOD BW87 WATERMARK	\$15.00	\$3.00
597	92-12	\$5.00 CHRISTOPHER COLUMBUS BW1992 - RARE WATERMARK	\$75.00	\$5.00
598	93-20	.29 JOE LEWIS BW92 WATERMARK	\$10.00	no bid
599	93-20	.29 JOE LEWIS BW PARSONS WATERMARK	\$20.00	\$3.00
600	94-09	.29 BUFFALO SOLDIERS BW1994 WATERMARK	\$10.00	\$2.00
601	94-14	.29, .40, .50 WORLD CUP SOCCER BW93 WATERMARK	\$25.00	\$3.00
602	94-14	.29, .40, .50 WORLD CUP SOCCER BW94 WATERMARK	\$25.00	no bid
603	94-14	.29, .40, .50 WORLD CUP SOCCER S/S BW93 WATERMARK	\$25.00	\$3.50
604	94-15	.29, .40, .50 WORLD CUP SOCCER S/S BW94 WATERMARK	\$25.00	\$3.00
605	97-25	.32 OPERA SINGERS BW1996 - LILY PONS 1ST STAMP 1996 WATERMARK	\$10.00	no bid
606	97-25	.32 OPERA SINGERS BW1997 - LILY PONS 1ST STAMP 1997 WATERMARK	\$10.00	no bid
607	97-26	.32 AIR FORCE 1997 WATERMARK	\$10.00	no bid

**MISCELLANEOUS LOTS
DESCRIPTION**

LOT	DESCRIPTION	VALUE	BID
608	BINDERS DUST PROOF WITH 25 PLASTIC SLEEVES - 6 AVAILABLE	\$20.00	no bid

609	1998	COMPLETE SET (9 PAGES) TRANS-MISSISSIPPI EXPOSITION - ANAHEIN, CA CANCEL CANON F	\$50.00	\$14.00
610	1987	JIM CANON AMERICAN LOCOMOTIVES BOOKLET FDC - FIVE PAGES	\$25.00	no bid
611	1993	JIM CANON COLUMBIAN COMPLETE SET 16 PAGES IN ALBUM - CANCEL CHICAGO 1-3-1993	\$50.00	\$16.00
612		#29, #148, #153, #157, #158, #159, #159A& #160 - JIM CANON PAGES - 8 PAGES	\$40.00	no bid
613	1986	PRESIDENTIAL S/S 4 SHEETS FDC USED IN MINT SET BOOK	\$25.00	\$2.00
614	1987	SOCIETY OF PHILATELIC AMERICANS 50TH ANNIVERSARY CANCEL 8-26-1987	\$15.00	no bid
615	88-43	.25 HONEYBEE COIL - EIGHT DIFFERENT POSITION - FLOATING BEE ON STAMP	\$40.00	\$4.00
616	1997	CIPEX S/S 50TH ANNIVERSARY CANCEL 5-19-1997	\$15.00	no bid
617	2004	14TH ANNUAL CIVIL WAR REENACTMENT OF BATTLE OF PEA RIDGE CANCEL 4-26-2004	\$15.00	\$2.00
618	1986	TIPEX SOUVENIR SHEET TIPEX NEW YORK MAY, 1986 CANCEL JIM CANON SPECIAL ISSUE	\$15.00	no bid
619	PNC'S	25 POUNDS OF DEFINITIVE UNPICKED FOR USED PLATE NUMBER COILS	\$100.00	no bid
620	MIX	25 POUNDS LOADED WITH COMMEMORATIVE STAMPS GREAT MIX	\$100.00	no bid
621	SC-18	5 POUNDS OF PRECANCELS UNPICKED FOR PLATE NUMBER COILS	\$75.00	no bid
622	MIX	ONCE OUNCE USED PNC'S SINGLES, PAIRS AND STRIPS GREAT LOT	\$45.00	no bid
623	1998	SPECIAL SYLVESTER & TWEETY PAGE - FDC	\$10.00	\$1.00
624	1987	"WE THE PEOPLE" BICENTENNIAL STATION CANCELS 13 PAGES	\$30.00	\$4.00
625	1987	SYMBOLS OF LIBERTY 4 BEAUTIFUL PICTURE PAGES	\$10.00	\$2.00
626	1978-2004	22 DIFFERENT BLACKS AMERICANS ON SOUVENIR PAGES	\$150.00	no bid
627	1986	CELEBRATE A CENTURY OF ORGANIZED STAMP COLLECTING IN THE UNITED STATES	\$5.00	no bid
628	1972	72-11 MAIL ORDER - DOUBLE TAILED CAT - THREE HOLED PUNCHED	\$10.00	\$2.00
629		P/CPOSTER BULLETIN MADE BY BUD SCRATOM - 88-45 - SETTLING OF OHIO/N.W. TERRITORY	\$5.00	no bid
630	1986	STAMP COLLECTING BOOKLET - JOINT ISSUE WITH SWEDEN FDC 1-23-1986	\$10.00	\$5.00
631	1994	CRANES - JOINT ISSUE WITH CHINA FDC 10-9-1994	\$10.00	\$5.00
632	1909-2010	CHRISTMAS SEAL COLLECTING COMPLETE IN THREE BINDERS - 126 FULL SHEETS, REST ARE	\$500.00	\$110.00
633	1941-2007	EASTER SEALS 45 FULL SHEETS - REST ARE PARTIAL SHEETS - STORED IN BINDERS	\$125.00	no bid
634	1952-1992	FATHER FLANAGAN'S BOYS TOWN - 38 FULL SHEETS - STORED IN BINDERS	\$100.00	no bid
635	1950-2010	CAL FARLEY'S BOYS RANCH - 30 FULL SHEETS - STORED IN BINDERS	\$100.00	no bid
636		MOSTLY WILDLIFE SEALS - 48 FULL SHEETS - STORED IN BINDERS	\$125.00	no bid
637		35 DIFFERENT ORGANIZATION ADVERTIZING THEIR SERVICES - STORED IN BINDERS	\$100.00	no bid